2026 Water Treatment Chemical Bids Final

City of Kent

JCI JONES UNIVAR Cascade Northstar
Item Location & Amount Chemical, INC Solutions Columbia Dist Chemical
i 3,300 h
1 Rl CEle LR CEE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(6) 1 Ton Chlorine Gas Total $19,800
2 s e L) xi NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(5) 1 Tons Chlorine Gas Total $16,500
3 Rasuiligoel Lok G NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(10) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $6,110
4 LHmBIETE SR G NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(4) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $2,444
5 ke Lok G NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(2) 150 Ibs. Chlorine Gas Total $1,222
NO BID NO BID $1.48 pound NO BID
Total $44,400
7 212th Treatment Plant NO BID $3.13 gallon NO BID $3.19 gallon NO BID
10,000 gallons Sodium Hypochlorite Total $31,300 Total $31,900
8 Garrison NO BID $3.78 gallon NO BID $3.98 gallon NO BID
1,200 gallons Sodium Hypochlorite Total $4,536 Total $4,776
9* 212th NO BID $6.29 pound $1.76 pound * NO BID NO BID
2,000 Ibs. Potassium Permanganate Total $12,584.84 Total $3,526.40 *
10 PS#5 $1.19 gallon $1.22 gallon $1.55 gallon $1.30 gallon NO BID
96,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $114,240 Total $117,177.60 Total $148,800 Total $124,800
11 EHW $1.19 gallon $1.22 gallon $1.55 gallon $1.30 gallon NO BID
12,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $14,280 Total $14,647.20 Total $18,600 Total $15,600
12 212th Treatment Plant NO BID $1.91 gallon NO BID $2.35 gallon NO BID
1,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $1,910 Total $2,350
1 3 Guib. Corrosion $1.19 gallon $1.22 gallon $1.55 gallon $1.30 gallon NO BID
8,000 gallons 25% Sodium Hydroxide Total $9,520 Total $9,764.80 Total $12,400 Total $10,400
Items 1-5 & 10,11,13| Items 7,8 & 12 Items 9 No Items
Totals
$184,116 $37,746 $3,526.40 $0

* Includes 10.2% WA sales tax



