City of Kent
2018 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

UNIVAR Northstar Cascade JCI JONES Wesmar CO, INC Brenntag Pacific Sierra Olin Chlor HASA, INC.
USA, INC. Chemical Columbia Dist Chemical, INC Chemical Alkali Products

Item #1 $ 675.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $4,050.00
ltem #2 $ 675.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,375.00
Item #3 $ 325.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,250.00
Item #4 $ 325.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $1,300.00
Iltem #5 $325.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $650.00
Iltem #6 $0.975 Ib.
Naf NO BID NO BID Total $29,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #7 $2.07 gal. $1.98 gal.
12.5% NaOCL Total $4,960.00 Total $4,752.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #8 $2.07 gal. $2.11 gal.
12.5% NaOCL Total $2,484.00 Total $2,532.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #9 $6.85 Ib. Total $2.73 Ib.
KMNO4 $6,850.00 NO BID Total $2730.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #10 $1.0855 gal. $1.45 gal. $1.09 gal. $0.93 gal ea.
NaOH 25% Total $104,208.00 Total $139,200.00 Total $104,352.00 Total $89,280.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
ltem #11 $ 1.0855 gal. $1.45 gal. $1.12 gal. $0.93 gal ea.
NaOH 25% Total $13,026.00 Total $17,400.00 Total $13,440.00 Total $11,160.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID
ltem #12 $1.01 gal. $2.05 gal.
NaOH 25% Total $1,010.00 Total $2,050.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #13 $1.0855 gal. $1.45 gal. $1.27 gal. $0.93 gal ea.
NaOH 25% Total $8,684.00 Total $11,600.00 Total $10,160.00 Total $7,440.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID

$2,484.00 Item #8 $29,250.00 Item#6 $12,625 Item #1-5
$1,010.00 Item#12 $4,752 Item # 7 $2730.00 Item#9 $107,880.00 Item #10,11,13

Totals: $3,494.00 $4,752 $31,980.00 $120,505.00
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