
UNIVAR NORTHSTAR CASCADE Airgas JCI JONES Olin Chlor EQUA-CHLOR Treatment
USA, INC. CHEMICAL COLUMBIA DIST. Nor Pac CHEMICAL, INC. Alkali Products Technology

Item #1
Chlorine Gas

Item #2
Chlorine Gas

Item #3
Chlorine Gas

Item #4
Chlorine Gas

Item #5
Chlorine Gas

Item #6
Naf

Item #7
12.5% NaOCL

Item #8
12.5% NaOCL

Item #9
KMNO4

Item #10
NaOH 25%

Item #11
NaOH 25%

Item #12
NaOH 25%

Item #13
NaOH 25%

$41,400.00 $870 Item #12 $79,925.00 $10,676.00
$9,600.00 Item #'s 1-5
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NO BID

Marubeni Specialty 
Chemicals, Inc.

City of Kent
2011 Chemical Bid Results

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$ 2.98 lb.         
Total $2,980.00

$1.57             
$7,536.00

$1.57             
Total  $3,140.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$ 0.87 gal.          
Total $870.00

NO BID $1.20 gal.         
Total $1,200.00 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$0.695 gal.        
Total $6,950.00

NO BID

$0.695 gal.        
Total $66,025.00

$0.695 gal.        
Total $6,950.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID Withdrew

$ 150.00 ea.        
Total $1,800.00

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID Withdrew

$ 600.00 ea.        
Total $3,600.00

NO BID

$ 600.00 ea.        
Total $3,000.00

NO BID

$ 150.00 ea.        
Total $600.00

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID Withdrew

NO BID Withdrew

NO BID NO BID NO BID Withdrew

$ 0.85 lb.        
Total $51,000.00 NO BID $ 0.65 lb.          

Total $39,000.00
NO BID

$ 150.00 ea.        
Total $600.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID $1.58 gal.         
Total $7,584.00

NO BID $1.58 gal.         
Total $3,160.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$ 0.74 gal.       
Total $7,400.00

$ 3.25 lb.        
Total $3,250.00 NO BID $ 2.40 lb.          

Total $2,400.00
NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$ 0.70 gal.          
Total $66,500.00

NO BID

$ 0.74 gal.     
Total $70,300.00

$ 0.825 gal.        
Total $78,375.00

$ 0.74 gal.       
Total $7,400.00

$ 0.825 gal.        
Total $8,250.00

$ 0.96 gal.       
Total $960.00

$ 1.70 gal.         
Total $1,700.00

$ 0.825 gal.        
Total $8,250.00 NO BID $ 0.70 gal.          

Total $7,000.00 NO BID

$ 0.70 gal.          
Total $7,000.00 NO BID

NO BID NO BID


