City of Kent
2020 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

UNIVAR Northstar Cascade JCI JONES Olin
USA, INC. Chemical Columbia Dist Chemical, INC Chlor Alkali

ltem #1 $ 700.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $4,200.00
Item #2 $ 700.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $3,500.00
Item #3 $ 400.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $4,000.00
Item #4 NO BID NO BID NO BID & AT e NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $1,600.00
Iltem #5 $ 400.00 ea.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chlorine Gas Total $800.00
ltem #6 $1.13 Ib.
Naf NO BID NO BID Total $22,600.00 NO BID NO BID
ltem #7 $ 2.65 gal. $2.11 gal. $2.13 gal.
12.5% NaOCL Total $4,240.00 Total $3,376.00 Total $3,408.00 NO BID NO BID
Item #8 $2.65 gal. $2.11 gal. $2.13 gal.
12.5% NaOCL Total $3,180.00 Total $2,532.00 Total $2,556.00 NOBID NO BID
Item #9 $0.831 gal. $1.08 gal. $.75 gal ea.
NaOH 25% Total $79,776.00 Total $103,680.00 NO BID Total $72,000.00 NO BID
Item #10 $0.831 gal. $1.08 gal. $.977 gal ea. $ .75 gal ea. NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $9,972.00 Total $12,960.00 Total $11,724.00 Total $9,000.00
ltem #11 $2.20 gal. $2.65 gal. $3.30 gal ea.
NaOH 25% Total $2,200.00 Total $2,650.00 Total $3,300.00 NO BID NO BID
Item #12 $0.831 gal. $1.08 gal. $.977 gal ea. $ .75 gal ea. NO BID
NaOH 25% Total $6,648.00 Total $8,640.00 Total $7,816.00 Total $6,000.00

$2,200 Item #11 $5,908 Item #7 & 8 $22,600 Item#6 $101,100 Item #1-5,9,10 & 12

Totals: $2,200.00 $5,908 $22,600.00 $101,100.00
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