
UNIVAR Northstar Cascade JCI JONES Olin Sterling
USA, INC. Chemical Columbia Dist Chemical, INC Chlor Alkali Water Technologies 

Item #1
Chlorine Gas

Item #2
Chlorine Gas

Item #3
Chlorine Gas

Item #4
Chlorine Gas

Item #5
Chlorine Gas

Item #6
Naf

Item #7
12.5% NaOCL

Item #8
12.5% NaOCL

Item #9
NaOH 25%

Item #10
NaOH 25%

Item #11
NaOH 25%

Item #12
NaOH 25%

$5,824 Item #7 & 8
$115,768 Item #9,10,12 $2330 Item #11 $16,650 Item#6 $14,099.94 Item #1-5

Totals: $115,768.00 $8,154 $16,650.00 $14,099.94
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NO BID

NO BID

City of Kent
2019 Water Treatment Chemical Bid Final

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 700.00 ea.           
Total $3,500.00

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 700.00 ea.           
Total $4,200.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 400.00 ea.           
Total $4,000.00

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 400.00 ea.           
Total $1,599.96

NO BID

NO BID NO BID $ 1.11 lb.             
Total $16,650.00

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 400.00 ea.           
Total $799.98

NO BID

$ 1.03 gal ea.          
Total $8,240.00 NO BID

$ 2.15 gal.               
Total $2,580.00

$2.08 gal.             
Total $2,496.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$ 1.03 gal ea.          
Total $12,360.00 NO BID

$2.49 gal.               
Total $2,490.00

$2.33 gal.             
Total $2,330.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$ 0.998 gal.              
Total $7,984.00

$1.272 gal.            
Total $10,176.00

$ 1.17 gal.            
Total $9,360.00

$ 0.998 gal.              
Total $11,976.00

$1.272 gal.            
Total $15,264.00

$ 1.17 gal.            
Total $14,040.00

NO BID

$ 0.998 gal.              
Total $95,808.00

$1.272 gal.            
Total $122,112.00

$ 1.14 gal.            
Total $109,440.00

$ 1.03 gal ea.          
Total $98,880.00 NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID$ 2.15 gal.               
Total $3,440.00

$2.08 gal.             
Total $3,328.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


